MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES

BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: WILKS TIRE & BATTERY - ALBERTVILLE, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear 52.000% 48.00% 48.00% 60.00% No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:

MOUNTING No Charge No Charge No Charge $25.00 $70.00 $70.00
BALANCING $15.00 $18.00 $20.00 $25.00 N/A N/A
VALVE STEM No Charge No Charge No Charge $5.00 $12.50 $12.50

DISPOSAL $3.00 $3.00 $4.00 $6.50 $30.00 $30.00

Total Service Amount $18.00 $21.00 $24.00 $61.50 $112.50 $112.50

Awarded 9/10/2025




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: ALBERTVILLE DISCOUNT TIRE LLC - ALBERTVILLE, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: MCGRIFF TIRE & SERVICE - CULLMAN, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: OLIVER TIRE PROS - GUNTERSVILLE, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: GILBERT & BAUGH - ALBERTVILLE, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC - BIRMINGHAM, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount




MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE, AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #20-25

NEW, ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT (OE) TIRES
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

VENDOR: WESTMORELAND TIRE - FT. PAYNE, AL

Medium Off Road
Police Auto Auto Radial Light Truck Radial | Commercial Radial | Off Road Truck Bias Truck Radial
Goodyear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Michelin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bridgestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Prices:
MOUNTING
BALANCING
VALVE STEM
DISPOSAL
Total Service Amount
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